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PURPOSE

To ensure pick-up process gets completed in the committed time and is done accurately.

SCOPE

Applicable to the following:

 Process Start: First communication / contact (via email) from client authorized contact for 
pick-up.

 Process End: Closure of Job Card.

This process is defined for pick-up process of data entry at client premises.

RECORDS

Record Number Record
Title

File / Folder
Name

Location
of Record

Responsibility Retention Period

OEC-OPS-PP-F-01 Pickup 
Request 
Instruction

Pickup 
Request

D Drive/ 
System

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-02
Transmittal 
Form

Transmissio
n Form

D Drive/ 
System

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP- F-03
List of 
Authorized 
Person

CIF
D Drive/ 
System

Sales/KAM Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-04
Checklist of 
Restrictions

Job Card
D Drive/ 
System

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ Local 
Pickup Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-05
Job Card Pick-up 

Collection

D Drive/ 
System

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/
Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-06
Master 
Schedule

Pick-up 
Collection

D Drive/ 
System

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/
Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-07
Pickup 
Sheet

Pick-up 
Collection

D Drive/ 
System

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/
Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-08
Delivery 
Challan

Pick-up 
Collection

D Drive/ 
System

Logistics 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-09
Pickup 
Checklist

Pick-up 
Collection

D Drive/ 
System

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Life of Document

OEC-OPS-PP-F-10
Logistics

Checklist

Pick-up 
Collection

D Drive/ 
System

Logistics 
Coordinator

Life of Document
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RESPONSIBILITY

The overall responsibility of the process lies with the Head - Operations.

PERFORMANCE MEASURES

As defined in the Metric chart

PROCEDURE / DESCRIPTION OF ACTIVITIES

On next page
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Activity Responsibility

Start

Receive Pickup Request 
Instruction and Transmittal Form 

(as applicable) from client

Send acknowledgment mail to 
customer (Auto- Responder)

Pickup Request 
Instruction Central Pickup 

Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Review the Pickup Request 
Instruction

Check for whether authorized 
signatory has sent the Pickup 

Request Instruction. 

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Check for completeness and 
Correctness of the data 
provided: No. of Files, 

Condition, Preferred Date & 
Time, Contact Persons Name & 

details.

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

X1

Acknowledgement

List of Authorized 
Person

Is the 
Pickup Request Instruction 

from Authorized 
Person? 

Inform the Requestor 
that the request will 
need to be sent by 
Authorized Person.

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Transmittal Form

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

No

Yes

A

A
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Activity Responsibility

Is the Pickup 
Request Instruction 
complete & correct?

Review the Pickup Request 
Instruction against the CIF and 
update Scope of work in Pickup 

Request Instruction

X1

Email Pickup Request 
Instruction to Local Pickup 

Coordinator

No

Yes

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Receive Pickup Request 
Instruction 

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

X2

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Client Information 
Form

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Site Assessment 
Report

Review the relevant Site 
Assessment Report prepared by 

Key Account Manager/ Sales 
Team

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Speak to the client contact and 
gather information on 

restrictions, if any

Checklist of 
Restrictions

Based on Checklist of 
Restrictions and Site 

Assessment Report decide on 
the need for  site visit

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

E

E1
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Activity Responsibility

X3

X2

Site Visit Required?

No

Yes Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Send site assessment 
request (email)  to Site 
Assessor (an member 

of pickup team )

Site Assessment 

Prepare Job Card and Email a 
copy to Client, Local Pickup 
Coordinator and Logistics 

Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Email Job Card & Checklist of 
Restrictions  to Local Pickup 

Team, Logistics Coordinator for 
the Scheduled Pickup

Job Card

Checklist of 
Restrictions

Confirm Schedule with client 
along with the inventorisation 

details as per the format.

Email

Local Pickup 
Coordinator
& Logistics 
Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Schedule work: Start- End Date/ 
Time, Daily Target and update 

Master Schedule

Local Pickup
Coordinator

Master Schedule

Client OK with the 
schedule?

Plan alternate date 
after discussing with 

client

Email the client with a cc to 
Central Pickup team about the 

scheduled visits 

No

Yes

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

B

Job Card
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Activity Responsibility

On the scheduled day drop 
empty boxes (cross strapped in 
sets of 25 with OEC stickers) at 

the client site prior to start of 
inventorizing

Take acknowledgment of the 
local contact/ security on the 

Challan for the number of boxes 
dropped

X4

Update the name of the 
Receiver and cartons delivered 

in the system and send an email 
to client contact and Local 

Pickup coordinator informing 
number of boxes dropped

Return acknowledged Challan to 
Local Logistics Coordinator

End of the day consolidate and 
update the completion of  

delivery in the system and 
update schedule

Logistics Team

Logistics Team

Logistics Team

Logistics
Coordinator

Logistics
 Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Inform the pickup team about 
the delivery of empty boxes 

Challan

X3

One day prior to the dropping of 
boxes, re-confirm visit time with 
the client contact and inform the 
same to Logistics Coordinator

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Challan

Challan

Master Schedule

Master Schedule
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Activity Responsibility

Review the files to be 
inventorized. Assess the time 

required and condition of files as 
per guidelines

Pickup Team

Pickup Team

Pickup Team

X4

Visit the client and meet with 
client contact. Carry out the pre-

pickup checks.

Pickup Team

Condition of files OK?

Inform Client about damaged 
files and update the Local 

Pickup Coordinator about the 
file conditions

OK

Not OK

Master 
Schedule

Guidelines on 
file acceptance

Agree with the client about the  
necessary / appropriate action 

that is required to be taken.

Local Pickup 
Coordiantor

X5

Local Pickup 
CoordinatorAny rescheduling 

required?

Ask the Pickup Team to carry on 
the inventorizing as scheduled

No

Yes
Inform the Client,  
Pickup Team and 

Logistics 
Coordinator

B

Local Pickup 
Coordinator
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Activity Responsibility

At the end of the day take the 
signature of client on the Pickup 

Sheet 
Pickup Team

Pickup Team

X6

Seal the boxes and stick the 
‘OEC Property’ stickers on each 

box

Inform Local Pickup Coordinator 
of work completed and Email 

the details of boxes packed (No. 
of boxes and files)

Work completed as 
per plan for the day?

Agree revised schedule with 
Local Pickup Coordinator

Update the Master Schedule

No

Yes

Master 
Schedule

C

Pickup Sheet

Pickup Team

Pickup Team

Pickup Team

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

Inventorize and carry out the 
data entry of the documents and 

update the Pickup Sheet

X5

Pickup Team

Pickup Sheet

Email

Has client requested 
new work outside the 

current Job Card?

Request the client for a 
new Pickup Request 

Instruction

A

Pickup Team

Yes

No

Transmittal 
Form

Share the Transmittal Form 
(Soft copy/ Hard copy)

Transmittal 
Form Pickup Team
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Activity Responsibility

X6

Visit the client for box pick up as 
per schedule

Job Card

Pickup Team

Logistics Team

Another day planned?

No

Yes

Meet the client contact and carry 
out  necessary checks 

Take client signature on  Pickup 
Sheet and confirm with the client 

the box pickup dates. Update 
Schedule

C

Pickup Team

Logistics Team

Pickup Sheet

Master Schedule

All OK?

Inform client about the issue and 
take their signature on the Job 

Card

Logistics TeamYes

No

Logistics Team

Complete the loading activity, 
update the Pickup sheet and 
handover a copy to the client 
contact and update schedule

Pickup Sheet

X7

Logistics Team

Job Card

Pickup Sheet

Job Card

Master 
Schedule

Logistics Checklist

Pickup Checklist

All printed copies except the MASTER COPY, and all electronic copies and versions except the one accessible on the OEC Intranet Server, 
are considered uncontrolled copies used for reference only.



OEC Records Management Company Pvt Ltd www.oecrecords.com

DEPARTMENT ISSUE DATE REVISION #

OPS
OEC-OPS-PP-P-01 2016-08-22 1.0

PROCESS FOR MANAGING PICK-UP PAGES

10 of 16

Activity Responsibility

X7

Take the boxes to the 
designated Warehouse and 

unload

Was the pickup
 done as Scheduled?

Analyse the reasons

Logistics Team

Yes

No

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Process for 
Measurement & 

Analysis

Do the Pickup entry into the 
system

Do the Registration into the 
system

Do the Data entry into the 
system

Logistics 
Person

Operations 
Person

Pickup Team

Do a three way maker-checker 
physical check (Sampling)

Local Pickup 
Coordinator

X8
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Activity Responsibility

X8

Yes

No

Pickup 
Team

Pickup 
Back officeOk?

Do a recheck of Pickup 
Entry, Registration Entry 
and Data Entry. Make 
necessary corrections

Local Pickup
Coordinator

Validate the data (Pickup Entry, 
Registration Entry and Data 

Entry)

Send the data to the client

Close the Job Card in the 
system

End

Local Pickup
Coordinator

Job Card

All printed copies except the MASTER COPY, and all electronic copies and versions except the one accessible on the OEC Intranet Server, 
are considered uncontrolled copies used for reference only.



OEC Records Management Company Pvt Ltd www.oecrecords.com

DEPARTMENT ISSUE DATE REVISION #

OPS
OEC-OPS-PP-P-01 2016-08-22 1.0

PROCESS FOR MANAGING PICK-UP PAGES

12 of 16

Activity Responsibility

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ KAM/

Sales Team

At the month end, send client 
the current List of Authorized 

Person

Request client to confirm in case 
of any changes

Start

Response received? 

Inform the client that the 
current list with OEC is 
considered as accurate 

list

No

Yes

Any changes?

Update the list

Send the updated List of 
Authorized Persons to Central 

Pickup Coordinator

End

No

Yes

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ KAM/

Sales Team

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ KAM/

Sales Team

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ KAM/

Sales Team

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ KAM/

Sales Team

Central Pickup 
Coordinator/ KAM/

Sales Team

Updation of List of 
Authorised Person
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Activity Responsibility

Site Assessor
Make a list of locations for 
Assessment (New clients / 

New Location)

Prepare a schedule for 
assessment and share with Key 

Account Manager / Sales Team

Start

Site Assessor

Key Account
Manager /

Sales Team

Key Account 
Manager /

Sales Team

Key Account
Manager /

Sales Team

Site Assessor

Site Assessment

Inform the client about the Site 
Assessment visit and take 

confirmation for visit date & time

Schedule OK ?

List of new 
clients

Site 
Assessment 

Tracker

Provide the revised dates after 
discussing with client to Site 

Assesor

Update the Schedule & Share 
with Sales Team / Key Account 

Manager

Carry out the Site Assessment 
and share Site Assessment 
Report with Sales Team / Key 

Account Manager

Any changes in 
contract required ?

Y1

Yes

No

Site Assessor

Site Assessor

Yes

No
N

Site 
Assessment 

Schedule

Site 
Assessment 

Schedule

Site 
Assessment 

Schedule

Site 
Assessment 

Report
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Activity Responsibility

Key Account
Manager/

Sales Team

Initiate discussion with the client 
for adding the points in the 

contract 

Send Site Assessment Report to
Central Pickup Coordinator

Key Account
Manager/

Sales Team

Site Assessment

Site 
Assessment 

Report

Y1

End

N

Site 
Assessment 

Report

Process for 
Contract 

Managment
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Activity Responsibility

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Call and request client’s contact 
for the required information 

Receive the missing information 
via email or telephone and 

update Pickup Request 
Instruction form

Central Pickup 
CoordinatorEmail

E

Pickup Request 
Instruction

Email updated Pickup Request 
to client for confirmation and 

wait for acknowledgment

Client confirms 
and sends 

acknowledgement?

Follow-up and Check  with 
client for any issues?

Take necessary action and 
resolve

No

Yes

E1

Yes

No

Pickup Request 
Instruction Email

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator

Central Pickup 
Coordinator
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ENCLOSURES

As per table contents

FORMATS / EXHIBITS
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